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Warren Buffett's preferred stock holdings in Berkshire Hathaway
surged to $14.8 billion, according to the latest filings on the
company's 13D filings with the Securities and Exchange
Commission. Buffett, the holding company's second-largest
shareholder, owns roughly 24.8 million shares, or nearly 1.8
percent of the Class A and B shares. The rest of his holdings are
made up of Berkshire stock and options. For 2001, Buffett has $78
billion in Berkshire shares and stock options. His shares and
options make up 2.1 percent of Berkshire, a 0.15 percent increase
since last quarter. Buffett has owned Berkshire shares since early
1970, and in November, he said he intended to hold on to his
Berkshire shares for the rest of his life. This quarter's filing
includes a document dubbed, "the Plan of Incorporation for the
Class A and Class B Shares of the Company," which provides
information about the ownership structure of Berkshire's Class A
and Class B shares. The filing also includes information on future
transactions that could affect the ownership structure of
Berkshire's Class A and B shares. The ownership of these shares is
outlined in the following chart: Click on image for larger version 1.
Warren E. Buffett owns a majority of the Class A and B shares of
Berkshire Hathaway Inc. Class A and Class B shares make up the
majority of the outstanding shares of the company. They are listed
on the New York Stock Exchange. 2. Matthew A. Munger, the son
of the company's chairman, owns stock representing the second
largest interest in the company. 3. George E. Berkshire owns 1.01
percent of the company's Class A and B shares. 4. Thomas T. Lee,
Jr. owns 0.78 percent of the company's Class A and B shares. 5.
Lawrence T. Lorshown owns 0.58 percent of the company's Class A
and B shares. 6. Larry G. Clausing owns 0.05 percent of the
company's Class A and B shares. 7. Jean M. Buffett owns 0.01
percent of the company's Class A and B shares. 8. Charlie Munger,
the company's vice chairman, owns 0.01 percent of the
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